City of East Grand Rapids
Regular City Commission Meeting
Agenda

August 21, 2017 – 6:00 p.m.
(EGR Community Center – 750 Lakeside Drive)

Note:

An executive session is scheduled for 5:20 p.m to discuss an attorney’s opinion in accordance with Section 8(h) of
the Open Meetings Act. The meeting will resume following the executive session.

1.

Call to Order and Pledge of Allegiance.

2.

Public Comment by persons in attendance.

3.

Report of Mayor and City Commissioners.

Regular Agenda Items
4.

Presentation from The Rapid (no action requested).

5.

Zoning variance hearing on the request of Joshua Brewster and Christina Vogelsang of 2818 Cascade to allow a 6’
privacy fence in the front yard (action requested – 39 notices sent).

6.

Zoning variance hearing on the request of Doug & Mia Walker of 1063 Lakeside to allow the construction of a 50-79”
privacy fence with a setback of approximately 3.5’ instead of the required 20’ (action requested – 61 notices sent).

7.

Zoning variance hearing on the request of Kurt & Laurel Ratering, owners of 1064 Lakeside, to allow:
a. a retaining wall and fence in the city right-of-way instead of the required 1’ setback (action requested –
55 notices sent).
b. a 4' fence in the front yard instead of the allowed 3'

8.

Consider request to approve the division of land at 929 San Jose (action requested - 90 notices sent).

9.

Review of conditional approval for 610 Lovett granted September 16, 2016 (action requested).

Consent Agenda – Approval Requested
10. Receipt of communications.
11. Minutes of the regular meeting held August 7, 2017 (approval requested).
12. Report of Finance Committee on disbursement of funds: payroll disbursements of $230,696.61; county and school
disbursements of $3,312,690.13, and total remaining disbursements of $420,955.63 (approval requested).
13. Consider request to adopt a resolution adopting a FEMA Hazard Mitigation Plan (approval requested).
14. Purchase of vehicles, equipment and accessories for various departments (approval requested).
15. Paving of Wealthy Street (approval requested).
16. Drainage at Public Works Complex (approval requested).
17. Preliminary minutes of the Joint Facilities Committee meeting held May 18, 2017 (no action requested).
*

*

*

The City will provide reasonable auxiliary aids for individuals requiring them for effective communication in programs and services of the City.
Notice must be made to the City five (5) days prior to the program or service requesting the specific auxiliary aid.

CITY OF

EAST GRAND RAPIDS
750 LAKESIDE DRIVE SE • EAST GRAND RAPIDS, MICHIGAN 49506
(616) 949-2110
www.eastgr.org
BRIAN DONOVAN
CITY MANAGER

MEMORANDUM
TO:
FROM:
DATE:

Mayor and City Commission
Brian Donovan, City Manager
August 4, 2017

RE:

Presentation from The Rapid

Officials from The Rapid willl be attending the City Commission meeting to present an update on the
operations and future plans of the transportation system.

BD/kb/9300
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TOM FAASSE
ZONING ADMINISTRATOR

MEMORANDUM
TO:
FROM:
DATE:

Mayor and City Commissioners
Tom Faasse, Zoning Administrator
August 9, 2017

RE:

REQUEST FOR FENCE ORDINANCE EXCEPTION – 2818 Cascade Road SE

Action Requested: That the Commission conducts a public hearing and votes on the application of the
owner of 2818 Cascade Road, SE, for a fence ordinance exception at that address, according to the
plans presented for relief from the following ordinance:
 Section 8.61B, to allow a six foot high privacy fence in the front yard of this property
along Cascade Road, east of the driveway
Background: Applicant Joshua Brewster, the owner with Christina Vogelsang of a single family
home at 2818 Cascade Road, SE, filed this application for an exception from the requirements of the
fence ordinance at that address in response to an April 3, 2017, notice of violation, and finally a
municipal civil infraction citation issued on June 8, 2017. (The court case is on hold pending the
outcome of this hearing.) The request is to allow a six foot high privacy fence to remain in the front
yard of this property. The fence is located parallel to the front property line along Cascade Road,
approximately 2-3 feet back, east of the driveway. Smaller fences are allowed in the front yard when
set back one foot from the front lot line, but the height is limited to three (3) feet, and the fence may
not be more than 50 percent opaque. The fence ordinance, which is part of the “Building
Regulations” section of the City Code, authorizes the City Commission to allow exceptions from the
strict requirements of the ordinance for “good cause,” utilizing the same procedure as would be used
for a zoning variance.
After being notified of the violation on April 5, 2017, while construction of the fence was still
incomplete, Brewster continued to work on the fence and emailed a number of rationalizations and
arguments as to why he should not be required to comply with the ordinance. Primarily, he has said
that the fence was installed to ensure the safety of his child from traffic. He filed a minimal
application for a variance on April 17 but did not pay the application fee until June 20, after the
citation was issued. He attached a copy of an older survey on which an inaccurate depiction of the
length and location of the fence is drawn, and which shows the property boundaries as including the
undeveloped lots to the east and west, which are separately owned. In fact, the fence extends
eastward well beyond his own east property line.
This fence is noncompliant due to height over three feet in the front yard, and because it is more than
50 percent opaque. In addition, it extends onto a neighboring property.

____________________________
Brian Donovan, City Manager

Karen Brower
From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

Laura Kaleefey <laurakaleefey@gmail.com>
Tuesday, August 08, 2017 12:40 PM
Karen Brower
Opposition of variance for 2818 Cascade Rd

Dear Ms. Brower,
I am writing to oppose the variance for the fence at 2818 Cascade Rd SE. I have noticed this fence on Cascade
and I find it unsightly.
I can understand the desire for privacy by the property owner. Cascade is a busy road. But, the fence appears
stand offish, which I believe is probably one of the reasons for the ordinance in the first place. If other
neighbors follow suit, many roads in East Grand Rapids would be walled off and will appear unfriendly.
Furthermore, and perhaps most importantly, the fence could pose a hazard to cars turning off of Pioneer Club
Rd. Cars may not be able to adequately see the zooming Cascade Rd traffic.
Thank you for considering my comments.
Laura Kaleefey
1563 Woodlawn Ave SE
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(616) 949-2110
www.eastgr.org
TOM FAASSE
ZONING ADMINISTRATOR

MEMORANDUM
TO:
FROM:
DATE:

Mayor and City Commissioners
Tom Faasse, Zoning Administrator
August 9, 2017

RE:

REQUEST FOR FENCE ORDINANCE EXCEPTION – 1063 Lakeside Dr., SE

Action Requested: That the Commission conducts a public hearing and votes on the application of the
owners of 1063 Lakeside Drive, SE, for a fence ordinance exception at that address, according to the
application presented for relief from the following ordinance:
 Section 8.61C, to allow a privacy fence that varies in height from 50 to 79 inches to
remain in the street side yard of this corner lot along Burchard Street west of the house,
with an estimated setback of approximately 3.5 feet from the property line instead of the
required 20 feet, a variance of about 16.5 feet.
Background: Doug and Mia Walker, the owners of 1063 Lakeside Drive, SE, filed this application on
July 13, 2017 for an exception from the fence ordinance at their address in response to a June 5,
2017, notice of violation. The request is to allow a recently-constructed privacy fence to remain in the
street side yard of this corner lot along Burchard Street, west of the house. It is set back
approximately 3.5 feet from the sidewalk instead of the required 20 feet, a variance of about 16.5
feet. (Lacking a survey, the exact location of the property line has not been identified.) Fences are
allowed in the street side yard of a corner lot to within one foot of the street side lot line, but the
height is limited to three (3) feet unless the fence has clear visibility through it, such as a chain linktype fence. Solid fences that are taller than three feet must be set back 20 feet. The ordinance, which
is part of the “Building Regulations” section of the City Code, authorizes the City Commission to
allow exceptions from the strict requirements of the ordinance for good cause, utilizing the same
procedure as would be used for a zoning variance.
The Walker application includes photos of the fence and an aerial photo map showing surrounding
properties. Their attached narrative statement incorrectly gives the height of the fence as 48 inches; it
actually measures 50 to 79 inches above grade at the top rail. They simply request relief from the
ordinance without stating in writing any reasons that the exception should be granted.
Zoning office records indicate that Mia Walker requested and received fence ordinance information
in March, 2016, prior to the construction of this fence. She has since indicated that they were aware
of the requirements but constructed the current fence in order to get privacy in the area that they use
as a back yard. Previously, this area did contain a picket fence and shrubbery as shown on the
attached Google street view screen capture from June 2011. That fence could have legally remained
as a “pre-existing fence” per the ordinance.

1063 Lakeside fence exception application

p. 2

Measurements were taken by staff at the site on July 25. The south west corner of the house, where
the fence starts, is 14.5 feet from the sidewalk. (The sidewalk is the approximate location of the
property line.) The fence extends 11 feet from the house, leaving about 3.5 feet between the sidewalk
and the fence. The height of the fence on the south and east sides of the enclosure ranges from 50 to
55 inches at the top rail. On the west side, the top of the fence is 79 inches above grade, and the
corner post is 89 inches.
All of the recently-constructed fence which stands within 20 feet of the street side property line here
con-compliant with the fence ordinance.

____________________________
Brian Donovan, City Manager

Karen Brower
From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

Laurel Ratering <ratering@charter.net>
Tuesday, August 08, 2017 4:46 PM
Karen Brower
Please grant fence exception for 1063 Lakeside Drive

Kurt and Laurel Ratering
9813 Earhart Rd.
South Lyon, Mi 48178
Dear East Grand Rapids City Commission:
We would like to urge you to grant an exception for the fence at 1063 Lakeside Drive. This beautifully, artfully and carefully
constructed fence enhances, blends, and fits perfectly with the style of the home of Doug and Mia Walker. The variety of
sizes, colors, styles and ages of the houses in East Grand Rapids lends to the unique charm of the neighborhood. We really
appriciate the commitment of the neighbors who use so much of their talent and time to carefully maintain these homes, and
update them in really cool ways. This fence is a good example of this commitment to detail, style and creativity.
We'd like to add, also, that any corner lot makes maintaining a bit of privacy very difficult. This lawn area is in view of cars
and pedestrians traveling on both Burchard and Lakeside. The fence as constructed in no way blocks sight lines or is in any
way a safety hazzard for walkers or cars, as the part of the fence closer to the sidewalk runs only along Burchard .
We would respectfully ask that you allow the fence to stand as constructed and grant an exception for 1063 Lakeside Dr.
Sincerely,
Kurt and Laurel Ratering
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CITY OF

EAST GRAND RAPIDS
750 LAKESIDE DRIVE SE  EAST GRAND RAPIDS, MICHIGAN 49506
(616) 949-2110
www.eastgr.org
TOM FAASSE
ZONING ADMINISTRATOR

MEMORANDUM
TO:
FROM:
DATE:

Mayor and City Commissioners
Tom Faasse, Zoning Administrator
August 9, 2017

RE:

REQUEST FOR FENCE/WALL ORDINANCE EXCEPTION
1064 Lakeside Dr., SE

Action Requested: That the Commission conducts a public hearing and votes on the application of the
owners of 1064 Lakeside Drive, SE, for an exception at that address from the requirements for fences
and walls, according to the application presented for relief from the following ordinance:
 Section 8.61B, to allow a front yard fence to remain in place that is four feet in height
where three feet is the maximum, a variance of one foot.
 Section 8.61C, to allow a fence and wall to remain in the street side yard of this corner
lot along Burchard Street; the fence has an estimated setback four inches or less, and the
wall is placed just inside the city right of way, where a one foot setback is required.
Background: Kurt and Laurel Ratering and their daughter Alisa, the owners of 1064 Lakeside Drive,
SE, filed this application on July 21, 2017 for an exception from the fence ordinance at their address
in response to a June 5, 2017, notice of violation. The request is to allow a recently-constructed fence
and wall to remain in the front yard and the street side yard of this corner lot. In the front yard, the
fence is properly located, but is four feet high where the limit is three feet, a variance of one foot. In
the south side yard along Burchard Street, the fence set back varies from zero to about 4 inches from
the property line where a one foot setback is required, but the new retaining wall is placed in the city
right of way. The fence and wall in the side yard are otherwise conforming as to height and clear
visibility. Fences and walls are allowed in the street side yard of a corner lot to within one foot of the
street side lot line, but the height is limited to three (3) feet unless the fence has clear visibility
through it, such as a chain link-type fence. The ordinance, which is part of the “Building
Regulations” section of the City Code, authorizes the City Commission to allow exceptions from the
strict requirements of the ordinance for good cause, utilizing the same procedure as would be used for
a zoning variance.
The Raterings purchased this home in early 2016 as a residence for Alisa. The fence and wall were
installed in the spring of 2017. The exception application includes the application, a narrative
statement, a 1979 survey, and photos of the fence and wall. Also included is a photo showing a
“before” view of the property from Burchard Street. Their attached narrative statement correctly
describes the dimensions of the fence and the wall and provides the reasons that they believe relief
should be granted. The location of the fence and wall in relationship to the property lines is not
addressed.

1064 Lakeside fence and wall exception application

p. 2

Using the survey provided by the applicants, city staff took measurements at the site on July 25.
Except for the portion of the fence near the front property line, which is approximately four feet high
where three feet is the maximum, the height of the fence is compliant, as is the clear vision design of
the fence. Unfortunately the retaining wall appears to be entirely within the city right of way,
between the property line and the back edge of the sidewalk. The fence that is installed atop it is
likewise not far enough back. As the application notes, there is a pre-existing stacked-concrete wall at
the edge of the sidewalk occupying the east 30 feet of the frontage along Burchard. The new wall was
constructed as a continuation of the older wall. In short, both the fence and the wall along the
Burchard Street property line are non-compliant because they are not set back at least one foot from
the property line.

____________________________
Brian Donovan, City Manager
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Memorandum
TO:
FROM:
DATE:

Honorable Mayor and City Commissioners
Tom Faasse, Zoning Administrator
August 9, 2017

RE:

Land Division – 929 San Jose Drive SE (41-14-33-401-024)
Zoned R-2 Single Family

ACTION REQUESTED: That the Commission conducts a public hearing and votes on the
application of the owners of 929 San Jose Drive, SE, for a land division of the above-listed
property which would create two conforming parcels as follows:
 929 San Jose, 85 by 293.2 feet (24,919 sq. ft.) containing the existing house, and
 939 San Jose, 85 by 293.2 feet (24,919 sq. ft.) containing an existing accessory building.
RECOMMENDED CONDITIONS: If the City Commission grants this land division request,
approval should be contingent upon two standard conditions that have traditionally been applied to
all land division approvals, and one special condition:




Compliance with the legal descriptions and surveys submitted with this application.
Transfer and recording of the relevant deed(s) or land contract(s) with the Kent County
Register of Deeds within 90 days of the Commission's action.
Before a certificate of occupancy can be issued for a new home at 939 San Jose, the
encroachment of the existing fence must be corrected.

BACKGROUND: Stephen and Mary Kretschman, the owners of 929 San Jose Drive, SE,
originally applied for a division of the property at that address in December, 2016. At that time the
property was zoned R-1, meaning that variances were required in order to split the lots, because in
spite of their large areas – each 24,919 square feet – the proposed lots lacked the 100-foot width
required in that zone. In February, 2017, the City Commission denied the variances and therefore
did not vote on the land division application. The Kretschmans subsequently took the lead in an
application to rezone their property and 22 neighboring parcels from R-1 to R-2. The rezoning was
approved by the City Commission on July 17, 2017, clearing the way for the applicants to revive
their land division application.
The parent property is rectangular, the largest parcel on this block of San Jose Drive at
approximately 1.14 acres (49,838 sq. ft.), with 170 feet of frontage and 293.2 feet of depth. It is
comprised of Lots 38 and 39 of Vinkemulder’s Subdivision, platted in 1927. (Survey and area map
attached.) The proposal is to divide the parcel, as originally platted, into two individual lots, each
85 feet wide by 293.2 feet deep, and each approximately 0.57 acres (24,919 square feet). The lots
had been held by the Kretschmans as separate tax parcels with separate legal descriptions until the
City of East Grand Rapids undertook to combine such adjacent nonconforming parcels in 2012.
Lot 39, on the north, contains the Kretschman’s single family residence, built in 1937 by Mrs.
Kretschman’s parents. Lot 38, on the south, is vacant except for a detached accessory building in

Kretschman San Jose Land Division Application
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the rear. If the split were granted as proposed, both existing buildings would have conforming
setbacks. An accessory building can remain on an abutting lot as long as both lots are in single
ownership. In the event that the applicants’ plans could not be accomplished and the ownership of
one of the parcels was transferred to another owner, our zoning ordinance would come into play,
as it does not permit an accessory use to remain on a separately-owned lot without a principal use.
A special condition of approval should not be necessary.
Fourteen statements of support from neighbors were attached to the original land division
application, and several additional statements of support have been received since then throughout
this process, making the neighborhood support nearly unanimous. Negative comments have not
been submitted.
A survey drawing and legal descriptions have been submitted with the application, as required.
The survey shows the current layout of the property and the proposed division, along with
buildable areas as defined in the zoning ordinance. The average front setback is estimated. Please
note that under R-2 zoning, the minimum side yard setbacks are 7.0 feet, not 8.5 feet as drawn
when the zoning was R-1. The locations and orientations of existing lots and buildings in the
surrounding area can be seen in the aerial photo that is included in the agenda packet with this
report.

REVIEW OF STANDARDS – LAND DIVISION ORDINANCE
Chapter 54, Section 5.406A of the East Grand Rapids Zoning Ordinance states: No platted lot
shall be split or divided or otherwise combined with any other lot, nor shall the boundary line of a
platted lot be altered, unless approved beforehand by the city commission pursuant to following
standards:
1. Lot area not less than required in the zone district – Please refer to the attached survey and
the comments above. Each proposed parcel exceeds the R-2 district requirements that
width and frontage must be at least 72 feet, and the lot must contain at least 7,200 square
feet of land area in the front 100 feet of lot depth. This standard is met.
2. Adequate easements for each lot to existing public utilities – Both lots are served by all
utilities and this land division does nothing to change the existing situation. This standard
is met.
3. The proposed land division will not adversely affect adjacent uses or properties and will
be consistent and harmonious with the character of adjacent properties (within 500 feet) in
the surrounding area, including consideration of the following:
a. Conformity with zoning ordinance standards; consistent and in harmony with nearby
parcels – This is a two-part requirement. (See above regarding conformity with zoning
requirements.) Within 500 feet of the subject property there are a variety of lot sizes,
all in single family use except for the triangle park known as “Campo Grande”. Almost
all of the lots in the area are elongated rectangles, and the proposed parcels are
consistent in this aspect. The majority of the lots along both sides of San Jose in this
block are of similar shape, width and area to the subject property. The properties along
San Lucia to the north and west of the proposed lots contain larger homes on larger lots
and remain in R-1 zoning. For this land division, a mathematical analysis of lot sizes
has not been conducted, but a visual analysis of surrounding properties using aerial
photography and REGIS data indicates that both of the proposed lots are consistent

Kretschman San Jose Land Division Application
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with – although somewhat deeper than – the other residential properties in the area.
This standard is met.
b. Conformity with nearby parcels as to size, width, and width-to-depth ratios – Please
refer to the information under “a” above. This standard is met.
c. The ability to develop building sites on each parcel without unreasonable disturbance
of floodplain areas, wetlands, drainage courses and terrain – There are no wetlands or
floodplains near the subject parcels. There is no indication that stormwater drainage for
surrounding parcels would be adversely affected by construction of a new single family
home. Storm water drainage is always addressed when a building permit is applied for.
This standard is met.
d. The relationship of front, side and rear yards and the orientation of buildings on other
existing parcels – The proposed layout is consistent with nearby properties. This
standard is met.
4. Will not place demands on public services, roads, and facilities in excess of their current
capacities – This proposal creates no demands that would exceed current capacities. This
standard is met.
All required application information as set forth in Chapter 54 of Title V, Subdivision Control,
Section 5.406D has been submitted and is on file with the Public Works Department. This
includes the required survey, legal descriptions, title search, and impact statement.

____________________________
Brian Donovan, City Manager

Stephen R. and Mary S. Kretschman
929 San Jose Dr SE
Land Division Request Application

Narrative Statement of Impact

Land Division Request Application: A statement of impact on properties in the
surrounding area resulting from the proposed submission. This statement shall
include, but not be limited to a review of the standards set forth in Section
5.406A(3) of the code.
The Kretschmans, residents at 929 San Jose Drive SE, wish to split their current
parcel back to the two lots that were part of the original subdivision (Lots 38 and
39). This would enable the Kretschmans to transfer their current residence to
their daughter and son-in-law.
third generation.

This would keep the property in the family for a

It would also enable the Kretschmans to build on the vacant

lot.
The two lots at 929 San Jose Drive SE were created as part of the Vinkemulder
Subdivision in the 1920s. As part of that subdivision, San Jose Drive was broken
into lots with street frontages of 75’ and 85’.

Lot 39 contains a two-story,

brick single-family residence built around 1937 while Lot 38, which would have
been 939 San Jose, has remained vacant. Lot 39 and Lot 38 were combined per
East Grand Rapids ordinance in 2012.

Building a house on Lot 38 would align

both lots with the original intent for the neighborhood, creating a consistent and
harmonious single family residential street front.
The two lots became individually nonconforming with the passage of an East
Grand Rapids Zoning Ordinance requiring a minimum lot width and area, set
forth for Zoning District R-1 in Table 5.28-1, greater than the existing lot widths
and areas and were required to be combined in 2012 per Section 14.5.114B(3).
On July 17, 2017, the City Commission approved rezoning of several properties,
1

including the Kretschman property, from R-1 to R-2. As a consequence, the two
lots would each now conform to the R-2 lot width and area requirements .
Allowing the vacant lot to be separated from 929 San Jose as a conforming,
buildable lot for a single family residence will not only be consistent and
harmonious with the character of the adjacent properties in the surrounding
area, but it will also prevent a future owner from tearing down the existing house
at 929 San Jose and building an out of scale, and out of context home,
potentially filling the current lot to the side setbacks (146’apart), which would
be detrimental to the properties in the surrounding area. The Kretschmans have
the approval of all of their neighbors for the lot split.
The proposed lots are harmonious and contextual with the neighbors. The three
neighboring lots to the North have street frontages of 85, while the three
neighboring lots to the South are 75’. The lots across the street are all 75
except for two lots are 112.5’ each, the result of combining and splitting three
75’lots in the 1930’s and the corner property that has a width of 150’ as the
result of combining two 75’platted lots.
An assessment of the property from 1979 states that “Vacant Lot 38 has a
highest and best use separated from the balance of the property, as a site
available for single family residential development. Lot 39 [929 San Jose Drive]
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has a highest and best use separated from the vacant lot as an individually
developed single family residence.”
A review of the standards of Section 5.406A(3) follows:

Section 5.406A(3)a: The proposed land division is in conformity, in harmony and
consistent with parcels within 500 feet of the proposed split as stated above, and
would be in conformity with the current zoning ordinance, which calls for a 72’
lot frontage for R-2 properties.

Section 5.406A(3)b: The size, shape, and areas of the two lots would be
consistent with lots in the surrounding area within 500 feet of the proposed split.
In fact, the two lots would still be larger than any of the other lots on the street
due to their depth.

Section 5.406A(3)c: The division would have no effect on floodplain areas,
wetlands, and drainage courses. The lot drainage would remain undisturbed.

Section 5.406A(3)d: The relationship of front, side, and rear yards for the
proposed parcels would be consistent and harmonious to yards and orientation
of buildings on other existing parcels adjoining the proposed parcels.
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CITY OF

EAST GRAND RAPIDS
750 LAKESIDE DRIVE SE • EAST GRAND RAPIDS, MICHIGAN 49506
THOMAS A. FAASSE
ZONING ADMINISTRATOR

Memorandum
TO:
FROM:
DATE:
RE:

Mayor and City Commission
Tom Faasse, Zoning Administrator
August 10, 2017
610 Lovett Avenue, SE (Coiffeteria) SITE PLAN REVIEW – FOLLOW UP

ACTION REQUESTED: That the City Commission considers whether to remove the first of two
conditions that the Commission attached to the September 6, 2016 Site Plan approval for Coiffeteria,
as recommended by the Planning Commission,
1. That Coiffeteria enter into a satisfactory shared access and parking agreement encompassing all
property owners and business tenants of 610 Lovett, 2135 Wealthy, and 2137 Wealthy prior to City
Commission review. (This agreement shall be recorded with the Kent County Register of Deeds.)

BACKGROUND: Attorney Catherine Jacobs represents Coiffeteria Salon owner Marielle Shuster.
There are existing, recorded shared access and parking agreements from 1993 and 2006. At the
September 2016 hearing, Attorney Jacobs’ position was that the existing agreements were sufficient
to satisfy Condition 1, however the parties have so far been unable to come to a common
understanding on this point. The City is now being asked to intervene in what is essentially a private
property issue.
On June 16 and August 4, the Finance Committee reviewed this matter at Coiffeteria’s request for
clarification of the City Commission’s intent. The Committee directed staff to have Coiffeteria
continue their attempts to work with the neighboring property owners and tenants regarding the
conditions.
The City Attorney has recommended the removal of condition one for several reasons. A site plan
review applicant must illustrate that they meet ordinance standards regarding traffic circulation and
access, and the application must illustrate the available parking. Actually, the subject property and its
commercial neighbors are within the “parking exempt area” of the Gaslight commercial district, in
which business are no longer required –as they once were historically – to provide a certain number
of dedicated parking spaces. Shared access and parking agreement issues are essentially matters to be
negotiated between private commercial property owners and occupants. Therefore, although wellintentioned, attaching this condition to the approval of the site plan exceeds what the city code
authorizes and requires as part of a site plan review process. He recommends that Condition 1 should
be removed.

________________________________________
Brian Donovan, City Manager
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PROCEEDINGS OF THE CITY COMMISSION
CITY OF EAST GRAND RAPIDS
Regular Meeting Held August 7, 2017

Mayor Seibold called the meeting to order at 6:01p.m. in the City Commission Chambers at the East Grand Rapids
Community Center and led the audience in the Pledge of Allegiance.
Present:

Commissioners Dills, Duncan, Zagel and Mayor Seibold

Absent:

Commissioners Hamrick, Miller and Schad

Also Present:

City Attorney Huff; City Manager Donovan; Assistant City Manager LaFave; Finance Director Mushong;
Public Safety Director Herald; City Clerk Brower

2017-112.

No public comment was received.

2017-113.

Commissioner Zagel thanked the community for their patience with the construction on Wealthy Street and
noted the project should be completed in time for the Taste of East on Thursday, August 17. The Taste of East
will be 5:30 to 8:30 pm in Gaslight Village with the proceeds benefitting Helen DeVos Children’s Hospital.
Mayor Seibold stated the relining process being used on Wealthy Street significantly reduced the amount of
time the road was closed for construction by relining the existing water main through access pits instead of
digging up the entire street to install a new main. She noted that representatives from several other cities had
toured the project recently to see what was being done.

2017-114.

Public Safety Director Herald presented chief citation awards to Daniel and Brooke Mehney for their actions
earlier this summer in alerting the authorities of a suspicious situation and then tracking and apprehending
suspects in a burglary in their area and the recovery of stolen property. The City Commission congratulated Mr.
and Mrs. Mehney and thanked them for their actions on behalf of their neighbors and the community.

2017-115.

KDL Director Lance Werner, KDL Board Member Craig Wilson and EGR Branch Manager Dawn Lewis
presented the Kent District Library’s 2016 Annual Report and answered questions on the many innovative
programs being offered in East Grand Rapids and around the community. Mrs. Lewis thanked the city staff
who assisted with facilities and equipment and the Friends of the EGR Library for all their financial assistance
with programs, supplies and the upcoming renovation of the upstairs entrance.

2017-116.

Duncan-Dills. To approve the consent agenda as follows:

2017-116-A. The minutes of the regular meeting held July 17, 2017.
2017-116-B. Payroll disbursements of $445,005.31; county and school disbursements of $1,960,268.08, and total
remaining disbursements of $708,695.57.
2017-116-C. Reclassification of the Zoning Administrator position from part-time to full-time.
2017-116-D. Ratification of the purchase of a network storage system from SCW of Marietta, Georgia in the amount of
$5,847.65 plus $500 for cabling costs.
Yeas:
Nays:

Dills, Duncan, Zagel and Seibold – 4
-0-

The meeting adjourned at 6:22 p.m., subject to the call of the Mayor until August 21, 2017.

____________________________________
Karen K. Brower, City Clerk

CITY OF
EAST GRAND RAPIDS
750 LAKESIDE DRIVE SE • EAST GRAND RAPIDS, MICHIGAN
49506
(616) 949-2110
www.eastgr.org
MARK A. HERALD
DIRECTOR OF PUBLIC SAFETY

MEMORANDUM
Date:

August 21, 2017

To:

Honorable Mayor and City Commissioners

From:

Mark A. Herald

Subject:

Pre-Hazard Mitigation Plan Resolution

Action Requested:

That the City Commission authorize a Resolution “For Re-Adoption of PreHazard Mitigation Plan” for the City of East Grand Rapids.

Background:

Hazard mitigation planning is any action taken to permanently reduce or
eliminate long-term risks to people and their property from the effects of both
natural (i.e., tornadoes, floods, hurricanes, severe storms, winter freezes,
wildfires, etc.) and man-made or technological hazards.
As a requirement to receive mitigation funding from the Federal Emergency
Management Administration (FEMA), East Grand Rapids must have a FEMA
approved Hazard Mitigation Plan. This plan must be updated every five years
and submitted to FEMA for approval. (The plan was originally adopted in
2012.)
Kent County, Ottawa County and the City of Grand Rapids Emergency
Management Offices have updated and submitted the local area Hazard
Mitigation Plan which FEMA has approved.
To be eligible for participation in FEMA grant funding, the City of East Grand
Rapids must approve a resolution adopting the Hazard Mitigation Plan. In June
of this year, the Kent County Board of Commissioners passed a similar
resolution formally adopting the plan.
The Finance Committee has reviewed this report and found it in order.

Approved:
Attachment

___________________________________
Brian Donovan, City Manager

CITY OF

EAST GRAND RAPIDS
750 LAKESIDE DRIVE SE • EAST GRAND RAPIDS, MICHIGAN 49506

“Pre-Hazard Mitigation Plan, Kent County, Ottawa County,
City of Grand Rapids, Michigan”
Resolution
WHEREAS, the City of East Grand Rapids recognizes the threat natural hazards pose to people
and property within our community; and
WHEREAS, undertaking hazard mitigation actions will reduce the potential for harm to people
and property from future hazard occurrences; and
WHEREAS, an adopted Multi-Hazard Mitigation Plan is required as a condition of future
funding for mitigation projects under multiple FEMA pre- and post-disaster
mitigation grant programs; and
WHEREAS, the City of East Grand Rapids fully participated in the mitigation planning process
to prepare this Multi-Hazard Mitigation Plan; and
WHEREAS, the Michigan State Police/Emergency Management Division and Federal
Emergency Management Agency, Region V officials have reviewed the MultiHazard Mitigation Plan and approved it contingent upon this official adoption of
the participating governments and entities;
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the City of East Grand Rapids hereby adopts
the “Pre-Hazard Mitigation Plan, Kent County, Ottawa County, City of Grand
Rapids, Michigan” as an official plan; and
BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that in coordination with the counties of Ottawa and Kent and
City of Grand Rapids will submit this Adoption Resolution to the Michigan State
Police/Emergency Management Division and Federal Emergency Management
Agency, Region V officials to enable “Pre-Hazard Mitigation Plan, Kent
County, Ottawa County, City of Grand Rapids, Michigan” final approval.

Adopted by the East Grand Rapids City Commission
at their regular meeting August 21, 2017.
__________________________________________
Karen K. Brower, City Clerk
City of East Grand Rapids, Michigan
/9295
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DOUG LAFAVE
ASSISTANT CITY MANAGER

MEMORANDUM
TO:
FROM:
DATE:

Honorable Mayor and City Commissioners
Doug La Fave, Assistant City Manager
July 27, 2017

RE:

FY 17-18 MERF Purchases

Action Requested: That the City Commission approve MERF vehicle and equipment purchases for
FY 17-18.
Background: The capital improvement budget for FY 17-18 included vehicle and equipment
purchases. When possible the City purchases vehicles and equipment through State of Michigan bids
through MiDeal or other collective purchasing contracts. This allows the City to realize savings for
purchases because of the much larger volume and economy of scale.
Vehicle replacements, MiDeal contracts and amounts are noted below:
•
•
•
•
•
•

Loader-replacement of 2003 #109: Contract #071B7700084, $182,500
Dump truck-replacement of 2000 #196: Contract #081716-NVS, $98,238.15 (cab/chassis) and
Contract #071B5500010 $28,511 (box, accessories).
Dump truck-replacement of 2001 #102: Contract #081716-NVS, $98,238.15 (cab/chassis) and
Contract #071B5500010 $58,734 (box, belly blade, accessories).
Mini Loader-replacement of 2009 #120: Contract #071B7700084, $85,000
Pickup truck-New truck to MERF-Parks and Rec, Contract #071B1300016, $31,753 (truck
with plow)
Police Interceptor-Command-replacement of 2012 #296: Contract #071B1300005, $26,284.

This has been reviewed by the Finance Committee and found to be in order.
_________________________
Brian Donovan, City Manager

CITY OF

EAST GRAND RAPIDS
750 LAKESIDE DRIVE SE • EAST GRAND RAPIDS, MICHIGAN 49506
(616) 949-4817

www.eastgr.org

DOUG LAFAVE
ASSISTANT CITY MANAGER

MEMORANDUM
TO:
FROM:
DATE:

Honorable Mayor and City Commissioners
Doug La Fave, Assistant City Manager
August 11, 2017

RE:

Wealthy Street-Gaslight Village Paving

Action Requested: That the City Commission approve a contract with A-1 Asphalt, Inc. of Wayland, MI for
temporary paving patches and grind/resurface of Wealthy Street from Lovett Avenue to Lakeside Drive in an
amount of $59,722 with contingency of 10% and to approve night work for grind/resurfacing of Wealthy
Street from Lovett Avenue to Lakeside Drive for a period of several nights to be determined in
September/October-authorizing relief of Chapter 91 of the City Code under exceptions, Section 9.15.
Background: The City has completed the cured-in-place-pipe water main rehabilitation on Wealthy Street
between Lovett Avenue and Lakeside Drive. To reopen this section of Wealthy Street in advance of
scheduled community events: Taste of East (8/17/17), Gaslight Criterium (8/20/17) and the Reeds Lake
Triathlon (9/9/17), the City will be placing temporary asphalt patches where the access pits for the water main
rehabilitation were located.
With community events taking place in late August and early September, combined with school starting on
September 5 and regular business activities in Gaslight Village, staff is requesting that the grind/resurface of
Wealthy Street be conducted during night hours, between 11:00pm-5:00am in September/October. Chapter 91
of the City Code limits the hours of construction noise to the hours of 7:00am and 9:00pm outside of
emergencies. Section 9.15 of this Chapter permits an exception for the City, pertaining to construction
timeframe/noise, for maintenance and repairs of City streets when public safety, welfare and convenience are
factored to balancing the activity during daytime hours. Notices would be sent in advance of street work as
well as through other communication platforms utilized by the City.
The bid solicitation results are as follows:
• A-1 Asphalt, Inc:
• Huyser Asphalt and Sealcoating:
• Superior Asphalt, Inc:
• Reith Riley, Inc:

$59,725 (patches and grind/resurface)
$85,431 (patches and grind/resurface)
No Bid Submitted
No Bid Submitted

The temporary asphalt patches portion of the total is $3,254 and will be accounted for in major streets asphaltroutine maintenance budget combined at $20,500 and the grind and resurface amount of $56,468 is accounted
for in major streets capital budget that has budgeted balance including Wealthy Street of $284,000.
The City has worked successfully with A-1 Asphalt, Inc in the past.

_________________________
Brian Donovan, City Manager

CITY OF

EAST GRAND RAPIDS
750 LAKESIDE DRIVE SE • EAST GRAND RAPIDS, MICHIGAN 49506
(616) 949-4817

www.eastgr.org

DOUG LAFAVE
ASSISTANT CITY MANAGER

MEMORANDUM
TO:
FROM:
DATE:

Honorable Mayor and City Commissioners
Doug La Fave, Assistant City Manager
August 11, 2017

RE:

Department of Public Works Complex Drainage Project

Action Requested: That the City Commission approve a contract with Lodestar Construction, Inc. of
Grand Rapids, MI for drainage improvements to the Department of Public Works Complex in an
amount of $104,043 with contingency of 15%.
Background: The Department of Public Works Complex is located on Reeds Lake Boulevard just
north of Lakeside Drive. With soil composition and a high water table drainage issues are present that
impact operations on a frequent basis. The City completed an engineering study and plans for
drainage improvements in FY 15/16 and budgeted for the project in FY 17-18 approved budget in the
amount of $125,200. The project will commence in late August and be completed in early October
before leaf pickup begins.
The bid solicitation results are as follows:
•
•
•
•
•
•
•
•

Lodestar Construction, Inc:
Groundhawg Excavating, Inc:
Redline Excavating, Inc:
Diversco Construction, Inc:
Georgetown Construction, Inc:
All Around Excavating, Inc:
Wyoming Excavating, Inc:
Nagel Construction, Inc:

$104,043
$127,248.50
No Bid Submitted
No Bid Submitted
No Bid Submitted
No Bid Submitted
No Bid Submitted
No Bid Submitted

The City has worked successfully with Lodestar Construction, Inc in the past.

_________________________
Brian Donovan, City Manager

EAST GRAND RAPIDS JOINT FACILITIES COMMITTEE
May 18, 2017
Woodcliff Administration Building

Present for the Schools:

Mark Hessler, Bob Hohman, Brad Laackman, Sara Shubel, Kevin Philipps,
Tim Johnston, Dan Luehrs

Present for the City:

Amna Seibold, Karey Hamrick, Jeff Dills, Brian Donovan, Fred Bunn,
Karen Brower

Bob Hohman called the meeting to order at 7:33 a.m.

1.

MINUTES OF MEETING HELD NOVEMBER 10, 2016
A motion was made by Karey Hamrick and supported by Jeff Dills to approve the minutes of the meeting
held November 10, 2016. The motion passed unanimously.

2.

CANEPA TENNIS CENTER
Kevin Philips reviewed the delamination issue with the concrete used on the courts and the efforts to resolve
the issue with the contractor. Jeremy from OAK explained that air and water trapped within the concrete
during the installation process had caused the surface to bubble and crack. The recommendation is to grind
off the top surface of the concrete, sandblast to open the pores and then place a new surface on the courts.
The work would be done under the one-year warranty with no cost to the city or schools. Work would begin
June 5 and be completed by August 4. Jeremy noted that it will be apparent within a year if this doesn’t fix
the issue and that OAK will stand behind the work.
Jeff Dills stated this should be a good solution as post-tension concrete should last nearly 50 years if
maintained properly.

3.

HIGH SCHOOL POOL BOILER & LIGHING PROJECTS
Kevin explained the lighting had been delayed during earlier work but was now being done along with the
pool boiler as part of the school bond project. The new LED lights will increase efficiency and may include
utility company rebates. Dan noted that one of the four boilers is being replaced; the other three will be
replaced in 2019. This new high-efficiency boiler will allow the system to divide the loads needed to keep the
system working better.

4.

JOINT FACILITIES AGREEMENT
Fred Bunn went over the updates included in the new agreement, including moving the capital improvement
exclusions into an exhibit for easier updating and changing some workflow and staff titles to better match the
current practices between city and school staff members. The new agreement will now be taken to the School
Board and the City Commission for final approval.
Bob Hohman thanked the staff for all their work in updating the agreement.

Joint Facilities Committee
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Sara Shubel stated that some of the facility charges may need to be updated. Fred will make sure the latest
versions of all exhibits are included in the final document.
A motion was made by Bob Hohman and supported by Amna Seibold to recommend to the City Commission
and School Board the approval of the updated Joint Facilities Agreement. The motion passed unanimously.

5.

MANHATTAN TENNIS COURT RESURFACING
Fred Bunn reported the repairs to the Manhattan courts are being moved up on the schedule from FY 19-20
due to cracking issues. Racquet Sports has provided a quote to repair the courts and resurface with both
tennis and pickleball striping for $12,300. The work will take 1-2 weeks, but no date has been set yet.
Brian Donovan noted that we may need to look at the court locations in the future due to the soils/water in the
area. This will be done in the Parks & Recreation planning process to see if there is a better location that
would allow a longer lifespan for the courts.

6.

HIGH SCHOOL POOL STARTING BLOCKS
Tim Johnston explained the starting blocks at the high school pool were slippery and cracking and needed to
be replaced. He had looked into getting the tops replaced but retrofitting the platforms created other issues.
The quote from The Lifeguard Store for new platforms and starting blocks is $33,305. The boosters and
Waves have raised almost $30,000 for this project so far and have committed to raise $28,000. Tim asked the
Joint Facilities Committee to give $5,000 to finish this project.
Jeff Dills thanked all the groups involved in the fundraising and thanked Tim for having such a great solution
in place before approaching the Jt. Facilities Committee.

7.

OTHER BUSINESS
Dan Luehrs reported that a portion of the Breton Playground has been blocked off due to a broken part that
cannot be replaced because it is no longer being manufactured. The FY 20-21 budget has $100,000 for
playground repairs at Manhattan, but this situation may require a switch of projects. He has received a quote
to change out the broken section for $60,000 with possible discounts, but this would not include disposal, site
work or installation.
Fred Bunn noted his staff has been looking for solutions to the problems of the aging playgrounds.

8.

BUDGET UPDATE
Kevin Philips noted the sand filter project has been completed in the capital budget and that $15,000 of the
$30,000 operational budget has been spent so far. He anticipated the same contributions from the city and
schools for the upcoming fiscal year and the same types of projects and maintenance programs as in prior
years. He noted that a pool reserve fund had bene started this fiscal year to begin saving toward future large
pool projects. With no major capital projects anticipated for FY 17-18, he felt the capital projects fund would
have a healthy balance at the end of the year.
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Karey Hamrick asked which scoreboard needed maintenance in the next year. Fred stated that with five
scoreboards there was always something needing repair so a line item is included in each year’s budget.
Kevin noted that if the artificial turf fields hold up well and only need regular maintenance, it may be possible
to decrease the contributions into the turf replacement fund at some point in the future and still have a balance
that allows replacement when needed.
Brian explained many years ago the playground funding provided to each location was almost considered
“seed” money for basic a playground and that each school building’s parent group had done fundraising to
provide bigger or more elaborate equipment. With that in mind, the PTO groups may want to plan ahead and
begin fundraising efforts if playgrounds need replacement in the next few years. Fred noted that currently the
Manhattan Playground is the oldest equipment with some repairs made three years ago.
Jeff Dills departed the meeting.
A motion was made by Mark Hessler and supported by Brad Laackman to approve the budget as presented.
The motion passed unanimously.

9.

OTHER BUSINESS
Amna brought up the issue of the recurring issue of the volume of the sound system at the high school
football field. We’ve talked about this repeatedly, but it is only turned down momentarily when someone
complains and then the next day it is back at full volume and disturbing the neighbors. She felt the neighbors
should not have to complain constantly. Tim Johnston stated he will take care of this issue.

The meeting adjourned at 8:30 am. The next meeting will be scheduled when needed.

Respectfully submitted,
Karen Brower
kb/jointmin

